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Abstract—Little is known about persuasive effects of figures of speech in the English of advertisements in 

Ghanaian press. In the current study, we focused on this persuasive effect of figures of speech in the English 

employed in advertisements in newspapers in Ghana. Since advertising is a genre of mass media 

communication which unearths the exceptional qualities of products and services in a persuasive fashion, it is 

also a form of marketing communication through which business organizations inform the general public 

about new or improved commercial endeavors. Therefore, language plays an indispensable role in the 

transmission of the message. The language of advertising influences the reasoning, thinking, feeling and the 

general attitude of the audience. The study reported about in this article was underpinned by the Conventional 

Figurative Language Theory, utilizing the qualitative content analysis approach as the analytical framework. 

The findings revealed that copywriters of the Ghanaian newspapers employed English figures of speech 

(tropes and rhetorical figures) in advertisements for persuasive effect.  

 

Index Terms—advertising, advertisement, copywriter, English language, figures of speech, print media, 

persuasion, communication 

 

I.  INTRODUCTION 

Advertising had been in existence for many years and it has evolved over time. As advertising developed over the 

years, it became sophisticated and assumed broader dimensions. In the past, advertising simply provided information on 

industries, manufacturers, products and services. However, today, persuasion has become an integral part of it. To 

achieve persuasion, advertising influences the thinking, feeling and behavior of the target audience. Advertising in 

modern time has gained prominence and has become essential due to competition in the world of business over goods 
and services (Skorupa & Duboviciene, 2015). Through advertising, industries, companies, firms and corporate 

organizations are able to inform the consuming public about the availability of goods and services.  

Presently, in the realm of business, advertising is employed as a form of marketing strategy which targets potential 

customers. Advertising makes it possible for manufacturers to sell their products to consumers. Since contemporary 

advertising is a form of mass communication, information about goods and services reaches as many people as possible 

and this goes a long way to promote businesses (Moriarty, Mitchell & Wells, 2009). In business circles, advertising 

enables companies and manufacturers to introduce new or improved goods and services to the target audience. Modern 

time advertising also serves as a reminder to existing customers about the memorable experience they had with a 

particular product. Advertising influences the purchasing decisions of the populace; for instance, one advertisement 

informs the audience that a particular product is the best among other similar ones (Clow & Baack, 2012).  

In contemporary time, advertisements abound in mass media. Creativity permeates the entire process of production of 
an advertisement. For an advertisement to be attractive and effective, the language, visual imagery, printing, auditory 

system, setting and dramatic effect are combined in a creative fashion. In its current form, every component of an 

advertisement, including the language, catches the attention of the audience. Language constitutes our most significant 

means of communication (Vestergard & Schroder, 1985) and according to Kannan and Tyagi (2013) it has a strong 

influence on the way human beings behave and respond to what is advertised. In this sense, copywriters employ 

attractive and memorable language for persuasive effect in advertisements. Myers (1997) is of the view that the manner 

in which copywriters use language for a particular effect is similar to the way language is employed in the world of 

poetry.  Put differently, copywriters use language differently from the usual literal way (Dyer, 1982). In fact, the 

language of advertising is in its own class; Leech (1969) and Goddard (2002) describe it as a piece of literary genre.  

From a general perspective, the language of advertising in modern time is simple and straightforward in the sense 

that copywriters, sometimes, use the literal and simple forms of language to communicate with their audience (Dyer, 
ibid). For instance, the English used in advertisements now, contains simple sentences some of which are imperative, 

declarative or interrogative in their communicative functions. If the English is direct and plain, it is comprehensible and 

therefore attracts the attention of the audience. This makes advertising message literal, clear, attractive and memorable. 

The informality of the English of advertising can be attributed to the fact that copywriters sometimes break the rules 
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that govern the language by constructing short sentences some of which are incomplete. Yet they are made to function 

as fully-fledged grammatical structures (Dyer, ibid). Other informal features of the English of advertising are the 

creation of new words and the misspelling of words. Seen from this perspective, the language of advertising in modern 

times is figurative in nature. At this level, copywriters tend to present the English of advertising in a way that departs 

from the usual standard use (Dyer, ibid). The rationale is to make the English language attractive to the audience. In this 

regard, copywriters may compare two unlike entities with the view of projecting the image of an advertised product. 

Copywriters may also exaggerate the qualities of a product or associate human attributes to an inanimate object. Many 

other figurative expressions are employed by copywriters with the view of making the English language attractive to the 

consuming public. Copywriters use English words to supplement the visual messages (Goddard, ibid). Words uplift the 

image of brands and advertisers. Copywriters choose words carefully; in fact, they economize words as it is done in 

poetry and the words contribute certain effect to the advertisement in its entirety. The English words used in an 
advertisement may paint a mental picture in the minds of the audience and this may make the message memorable 

(Torto, 2017). The English words in an advertisement may also appeal to the senses of the audience and this may make 

a potential consumer imagine an experience with an advertised product or service. In the current study, we investigated 

the use of figures of speech in the English employed in advertisements by copywriters in the Ghanaian newspapers and 

focused on both tropes and rhetorical figures.   

Research problem  

For the purpose of this article, we sought to address the problem of how persuasive effects of the figures of speech in 

the English of advertisements in the Ghanaian newspapers in terms of the Conventional Figurative Language Theory 

(CFLT hereafter). Given the international reach of the English language, conceptualizing the problem of persuasive 

effects of the figures of speech in the English of advertisements in the Ghanaian newspapers beyond Ghana and Africa 

at large is inevitable.   

II.  THEORETICAL FRAMEWORK 

The theory that underpinned the current study was the Conventional Figurative Language Theory (CFLT). This 

theory was designed and developed by Dobrovol’skij and Piirainen (2005) to complement the Cognitive Theory of 

Metaphor (CTM) which was propounded by Reddy (1979) and developed by Lakoff, Johnson and their colleagues 

(Lakoff & Johnson 1980, 1999; Lakoff 1993; Lakoff & Turner, 1989). In the framework of CTM, the linguistic 

resources which were proposed proved to be appropriate for the analysis of different metaphorical expressions. 

However, Dobrovol’skij and Piirainen (2005) discovered that it was not absolutely adequate to describe idioms, 

metaphors and other figurative units using just the tools of CTM. Their reason for this was that CTM was not developed 

with the intention to analyze more complex features of the semantics of figurative units. According to Dobrovol’skij 

and Piirainen (ibid), CTM was aimed at investigating general stream of thoughts that govern different categories of 

conceptualizations. Dobovol’skij and Piirainen (ibid) therefore developed a new theory, namely, the Conventional 
Figurative Language Theory, to fill the gap in CTM. The Conventional Figurative Language Theory (CFLT) can be 

perceived as a major theoretical breakthrough in understanding the cognitive foundations of metaphors, idioms and 

other figurative units. CFLT applies to figurative language in two ways: imagery and semantics. According to 

Dobrovol’skij and Piirainen (2006), the thematic trend of CFLT is that there is a specific conceptual framework forming 

the basis of the meaning of a figure of speech. This conceptual structure, which the authors referred to as the image 

element, is based on mental imagery and is a constituent element of the content of a particular figurative unit. 

Dobrovol’skij and Piirainen (ibid) defined the image component as a specific conceptual structure operating between 

lexical units and the denotative meaning of figures of speech. The image component, according to Granger and Meunier 

(2008), is a theoretical construct providing an improved account of the interaction between form and meaning in 

figurative units. The CFLT stresses the image component as a specific conceptual structure and a relevant element of 

the meaning of figurative units.  

For the achievement of the complete description of the function of idioms and other figurative units, it is important to 
take cognizance of other concepts as well which in many circumstances govern the transition from literal to figurative. 

The CFLT unearths the relevant features of conventional figurative units such as idioms, proverbs, metaphors and other 

figures of speech. Our choice of CFLT in the present study also rendered support to the analysis of figurative units in 

advertisements we drew on. The figurative expressions in the English of advertising contain one or more figures of 

speech which alter the standard meaning (Murfin & Ray 1998). In the English of advertising, a figure of speech is a 

literary device that entails unusual use of the language to associate one thing with another or compare unlike entities.  

The use of figures of speech in the English of advertisements is a departure from the usual syntactic pattern of words or 

from the literal meaning of lexical items to create mental pictures (Abrams & Harpham, 2005). Many figures of speech 

occur in the English of advertising and they are generally divided into rhetorical figures and tropes.  The use of 

rhetorical figures in the English of advertisements is a departure from the usual order of words. With rhetorical figures 

copywriters use words in a special way to create an effect without bringing about a significant change in the meaning of 
words. Antithesis, apostrophe, anaphora, parallelism, pun, rhetorical questions are some examples of rhetorical figures. 

On the other hand, the use of tropes in the English of advertisements is a departure from the usual literal meaning of 

words. Tropes bring about a change in the meaning of words; copywriters use words or phrases in such a way that they 
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mean other things. Personification, metonymy, metaphor, synecdoche, simile are some examples of tropes. Figurative 

expressions in the English of advertising are creative syntactic structures which catch readers’ attention and persuade 

them to take purchasing decisions on advertised products. Therefore, for the purpose of our study, we found the CFLT 

to be sufficient for our investigations into the realm of figurative expressions as it provided us with well-developed 

linguistic resources. 

III.  A BRIEF REVIEW OF THE LITERATURE 

In order to understand the problem of persuasive effect of figures of speech in the English of advertisements in the 

Ghanaian press, we situate the problem in studies conducted in the English speaking world before we place the issue in 

the Ghanaian context. Our broadening the theoretical foundation to the international English perspective is borne out by 

the British postcolonial models which have guided the Ghanaian printed press since its independence from Great Britain 

in 1957.  We therefore first trace the research model back to the United Kingdom (UK) 
In the UK, the work of Leech (1966) played a pioneering role into the use of English in advertisements. In that study, 

the grammatical analysis revealed the use of words, phrases, clauses and sentences in the advertisements. From Leech 

(1966), minor grammatical units such as phrases and non-finite clauses were used as if they were independent or fully-

fledged grammatical structures. The purpose of this approach was to attract consumers’ attention. From the semantic 

perspective, Leech (1966) postulated that the meaning of some advertising texts could be arrived at as a result of a 

collective interpretation of the lexical items employed in the advertisement. According to Leech, the English used in the 

advertisements that he studied were both idiomatic and figurative. Indeed, figures of speech were used in the advertising 

texts to either compare different phenomena or suggest a similarity and this created striking and memorable images. 

Human characteristics were bestowed on non-human entities in order to create mental pictures of advertised products. 

From the phonological perspective, Leech (1966) reported the use of sound effect devices in the English of advertising 

in Great Britain. This made the advertisements intriguing and attractive. Leech (1966) revealed that the rules governing 
the English language were violated in the advertising texts he analyzed in the media in the United Kingdom. According 

to Leech (1966) rules were broken at the orthographic level where words were spelt differently for the purpose of 

drawing attention to themselves.  Harris (1989) points out that in the language of advertisements, linguistic rules are 

violated and this has a great impact on consumers. Leah (2001) researched into rule–breaking in a range of 

advertisements in French and English.  Leah (2001) posits that linguistic violation is a tool advertisers use to make the 

product more attractive and to make the advertisement more effective. Leech (1966) revealed the different components 

of the English of advertising in the media of Great Britain from the syntactic, morphological, grammatical, semantic, 

phonological and figurative perspectives. What is yet to be known is the persuasive effect of these components of 

English on consumers. 

Koteyko (2015) also did a study on the English employed in advertisements in the print media in the United 

Kingdom. The study covered a cross-section of the newspapers and magazines in Britain and an enormous database of 
advertisements was generated for analysis; the corpus comprised three hundred and sixty-four (364) advertising texts. 

Koteyko (2015) employed a mixed method research design. She made use of numerical data and also interpreted and 

described the corpus of the advertising texts in her analysis. Koteyko (2015) adopted the multi-dimensional (MD) 

analytical framework of Biber (1988) in her linguistic analysis of the corpus. The MD model enabled her to represent 

the advertisement texts statistically based on the grouping of the grammatical units. It is worth noting that the MD 

framework had been applied to some linguistic investigations (Grieve, Biber, Friginal & Nekrasova, 2011; Biber 2006; 

Cao & Xiao 2013) but not to advertising. Koteyko (2015) bridged the gap in the application of the MD method to her 

analysis of the English of advertising in the British press. Koteyko (2015) employed the purposive sampling technique 

in the data collection process. In this regard, varied product advertisements were selected for the study; other data 

classifications were done based on the social status of the target audience of the advertising texts. The MD enabled the 

researcher to collect the data statistically and this was followed by a qualitative analysis as well. Then, the research 

corpus was categorized and labeled. This took the form of tagging and parsing as it was done in the British version of 
the International Corpus of English (Nelson, Wallis & Aarts, 2002). Koteyko (2015) discovered variations in the 

English employed in the advertisement corpus. Another research finding was that different grammatical units occurred 

in the varied advertising texts and they exhibited different communicative functions. Koteyko (2015) also revealed that 

the English of advertisements in the British press reflected the sociolinguistics of the consuming public. Thus, the 

English employed in the research corpus considered the variations in gender of the audience. While the English of the 

female advertisement was detailed and descriptive, the male advertisement was brief and more straight-forward. From 

Koteyko (2015). While Koteyko (2015) investigated the use of English to reflect gender distinctions in persuasion in the 

media in the UK, the current study focused solely on use of figures of speech in the Ghanaian press. The current study 

fills the gap in the literature by investigating the use of figures of speech which forms part of the English of advertising 

in the print media in Ghana.  

 Noriega and Blair (2008) did a psycholinguistic study of advertising to bilinguals in the United States (US). They set 
out to investigate whether the language that a copywriter advertized in, influenced the thinking process of the bilingual 

consumers in the US. It was hypothesized that an advertisement in the first language of bilinguals in the US might 

trigger thoughts about friendship, family relations, native country or domicile and this might lead to positive behavioral 
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patterns. According to Linton (2004), the bilingual situation in the US is such that the immigrants speak their native 

languages at home and its environs while English is spoken at other settings outside the home domain. By this linguistic 

pattern, the bilinguals in the US preserve their native languages. For Noriega and Blair (2008), in advertising, if 

different languages are employed they will elicit distinct attitudes and thoughts about the advertized products and 

services. Previous research on language choice in advertising and its effect on bilinguals revealed that if an 

advertisement was in the native language of bilinguals it was more effective. The fact is that bilinguals give the 

advertisements they can identify with much attention; they feel recognized, acknowledged and respected (Deshpande, 

Hoyer & Donthu 1986; Deshpande & Stayman 1994; Whittler, 1991). The choice of the native language of bilinguals 

by advertisers makes it easier for the bilinguals to comprehend the message of the advertisement. Prior studies revealed 

that if the message of the advertisement was in the bilinguals’ second language, the bilingual might not be able to 

understand all the words of the advertisement (Luna & Peracchio, 1999, 2001). From another perspective, other studies 
revealed that some words in the native language of bilinguals appealed more to their feelings than words in the second 

language. This might be due to socio-cultural differences, in that, the culture of bilinguals might uphold certain 

concepts highly and this is realized linguistically (Luna & Peracchio, 2002, 2005). Thus, Noriega and Blair (2008) filled 

the research gap by investigating the extent to which language choice in advertising influenced the thinking of 

bilinguals in the US.    

The findings of Noriega and Blair’s (2008) research revealed that language influences the way we think about an 

advertisement and our decision to purchase an advertised product. This confirms the declaration of previous studies that 

language influences human thinking and cognition (Larsen, Schrauf, Fromholt & Rubin 2002; Marian & Neisser, 2000; 

Fivush, 1998). From Noriega and Blair (2008), advertisements that were in respondents’ native language had more 

influence on thoughts related to friendship, family relations, country of origin and domicile than advertisements in the 

second language. Another finding of Noriega and Blair (2008) was that language had a relationship with context. From 
the study, the contextualization of the advertisement corpus, triggered positive thoughts about the advertisement, brand 

and purchasing intentions. The research results also revealed that the choice of language in an advertisement was 

essential as it influenced certain positive thinking processes which yielded positive attitudes. From Noriega and Blair’s 

(2008) study it can be deduced that in the US advertisements in the bilinguals’ first language trigger positive thoughts 

and attitudes and this enhances the effectiveness of the advertisement. 

Noriega and Blair (2008) and the current study were both based on print media advertising. However, while the 

current study was based on only English, Noriega and Blair (2008) involved English and the first languages of 

respondents. Noriega and Blair’s (2008) research was also sociolinguistic to some extent as it covered the use of 

language in its social context.  

In the Ghanaian context, Duah (2007) did a linguistic study of advertisements in newspapers and radio broadcasts. 

The study discovered the use of colloquial expressions, hedging, cultural elements in the languages that were employed 
in the advertisements. In the study, the diction of the advertisements contributed to their persuasive effectiveness since 

the selected words were comprehensible to the readers. Although Duah (2007) and the current study were both based on 

linguistic analysis of advertisements, a number of differences existed: while Duah (2007) was bilingual (English and 

Akan: a Ghanaian language), the present study was monolingual (only English). Whereas the current study was on the 

print media (newspapers), Duah (2007) was on both print and electronic media (newspapers and FM radios). The 

current study investigated the use of figures of speech in the English of advertisements by copywriters for persuasion in 

the Ghanaian press.   

Anim-Ayeko (2012) also analyzed metaphors in the English of political advertisements that were published in some 

Ghanaian newspapers. Her study was limited to the metaphorical expressions which were linguistic, pictorial and 

gestural. The current study also investigated the use of metaphors and other figures of speech in the English of 

advertisements in the print media in Ghana. The use of figures of speech in the English of the advertisements departed 

from their literal meaning to create an image in the reader’s mind. The figures of speech were characterized by unusual 
use of language and they were divided into rhetorical figures and tropes (Torto, 2010). Anim-Ayeko (2012) focused on 

metaphors in political advertisements in the print media in Ghana. Nonetheless, other figures of speech that needed to 

be known were rhetorical figures and other tropes. These were the research gaps in Anim-Ayeko (2012) that the current 

study filled. 

IV.  METHODOLOGY 

Our study was based on the qualitative research design as it allowed us to describe, explain and interpret collected 

data (Williams, 2007; Cohen, Manion & Morrison, 2000). The qualitative research design is generally based on social 

constructivism (Berger & Luekmann, 1967; Lincoln & Guba, 1985). The social constructivist school of thought 

assumes that people try to comprehend the world in which they exist and they do this conceptualization from personal 

perspectives. The goal of a qualitative study that is based on a social constructivist perspective is to depend on the views 

of the research participants on the situation under investigation. According to Creswell (2009), qualitative researchers 
make interpretations of what they observe, hear and understand; therefore, given the interpretive nature of the current 

study, the qualitative research design was deemed relevant. Based on this, the aspect of qualitative research that 

concerned the present study was the assumption made by Crotty (1998) that qualitative research is largely subjective. 
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Since qualitative researchers collect data themselves through observation, interview and examination of documents, our 

research employed the content analysis approach to qualitative research. Initially, researchers used the content analysis 

approach in either a quantitative or qualitative research (Berelson, 1952). Later, content analysis was employed 

basically as a quantitative research methodology, with text data coded and described statistically. In recent times, the 

potential of content analysis as an analytical approach to qualitative research for studies in the medical field has gained 

currency and this has led to a rise in its use in many qualitative studies (Nandy & Sarvela, 1997). We employed the 

qualitative content analysis approach as a method for the analysis of text data. The reasons were that content analysis 

enabled us to conduct a comprehensive analysis of the subject matter of specific textual material for the identification of 

research trends, patterns and themes (Leedy & Ormrod, 2001). Content analysis also provided us with access to 

information and understanding of the phenomena under investigation (Downe-Wambolt, 1992). We thus derive 

meaning from the interpretation of the data collected.   
Based on the research methods above, the following research question guided us in addressing the research problem: 

how do persuasive effects of the figures of speech in the English of advertisements manifest in the Ghanaian 

newspapers? 

V.  ANALYTICAL FRAMEWORK 

The analytical framework of our study was the qualitative content analysis (QCA) approach to the analysis of text 

data. Content analysis offers researchers the opportunity to analyze textual data in a way that suits their research interest 

(Cavanagh, 1997).  The QCA analytical approach focuses on the linguistic features as well as the semantics of the text 

(Lindkvist, 1981; McTavish & Pirro, 1990; Tesch, 1990). With QCA, textual data might be lexical items in print or 

electronic form and they might have been derived from interviews, survey questions, narratives, focus-group 

discussions or print media (Kondracki & Wellman, 2002). In the application of the QCA technique, the researcher does 

not just determine the lexical density of the texts but he or she conducts a thorough linguistic analysis of the texts data 
(Webber, 1990). Although there are a number of analytical approaches in content analysis ranging from interpretation to 

textual analysis and qualitative researchers choose the suitable type (Webber, 1990; Rosengren, 1981), we found the 

QCA to be most suitable to our work for its superiority in both enabling us to interpret textual data through a coding 

process as well as the opportunity it afforded us in deriving themes and trends in the study (Hsieh & Shanon, 2005). 

VI.  RESULTS 

The findings from the analysis of the advertising texts indicated that the figures of speech employed by copywriters 

in the Ghanaian press for persuasive effect were underpinned by the Conventional Figurative Language Theory. In the 

current study, we discovered that the use of figures of speech in the English of the advertising texts made it possible for 

copywriters to present the English language in an unusual and attractive way. Figurative expressions in the English of 

the advertising texts gave the language a meaning different from the literal interpretation. This had persuasive effect on 

the audience as the figurative English was striking and it created a mental picture about the advertised products. The 
following section is an analysis of the textual data and a discussion of the findings. 

Text 1 

The New Nissan Almera 

Sees the unforseen 

With clever engineering and technology, the new Nissan Almera makes reversing a breeze with rear parking sensors 

that ensure even the tightest parking spots become a precision exercise. 

Modern styling 

Spacious interior 

Economical 

(Daily Graphic, Tuesday, October 17, 2017, P. 8) 

The text above opens with the personification figure of speech in which the copywriter confers a human attribute on 

the car which is the subject of the advertising text. By the use of the personification trope, the copywriter presents the 
car as a human being with supernatural powers: The New Nissan Almera sees the unforeseen. The car has been 

portrayed as a kind of prophet or fortune-teller to herald the news of the rear parking sensors of the New Nissan Almera. 

The text commences on a note of attraction to the new feature of the car.  In the above text, the clause the new Nissan 

Almera makes reversing a breeze with rear parking sensors departs from the usual standard meaning; it is metaphorical. 

The copywriter makes a direct comparison of two dissimilar things reversing and a breeze to suggest an identity 

between them. The copywriter presents one thing as another and this creates a striking image in the reader’s mind. The 

metaphor yields another meaning which is the safety that is assured when the Nissan Almera is driven in a reverse 

direction.  The metaphor in the English of the text is enticing. The reader may want to experience the reversing 

technology of the advertised car.  

The copywriter makes use of another metaphorical expression in the English of the text. In the following relative 

clause that ensure even the tightest parking spots become a precision exercise the copywriter compares two unlike 
entities the tightest parking spots and precision exercise to suggest a similarity between them. This is also a comparison 
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that presents one thing as another. By the use of this metaphor a mental image is created about the safety and security of 

the reversing mechanism of the New Nissan Almera. This implies that with the rear parking sensors of the car, the 

potential buyer will not hit the back of the car against a stationary object. The copywriter identifies a likeness between 

two dissimilar things to achieve a rhetorical effect. 

Apart from the personification and metaphor in the English of the advertising text above, the copywriter also makes 

use of the synecdoche figure of speech. With the use of synecdoche, the copywriter presents part of the car the rear 

parking sensor to represent the whole of the New Nissan Almera. Part of the car has been used as a representation of the 

entire car. In other words, the copywriter has turned the rear parking sensor into something else. There has been quite a 

radical use of the English of the text as the use of synecdoche makes the English of the text figurative. The use of 

synecdoche paints a picture in the mind of the reader. In another sense, every part of the car like the rear parking sensor 

guarantees the safety of the owner. 

Text 2 

Quality in a sachet 

Cool, fresh and clean 

Introducing Voltic Cool Pac, lovely voltic quality at an affordable price. With cool pac’s treated water… 

Enjoy the high quality standards that Voltic (Gh) Limited is famous for. 

Why compromise on Quality?  

(The Mirror, Friday, January 6-12, 2017, P.26) 

The first line of the text Quality in a sachet illustrates the copywriter’s use of the metonymy trope. In this phrase, the 

name of one thing quality is used to represent another thing, water. Similarly, the name sachet is applied to the final 

product Voltic Cool Pac with which it has become closely related. In this situation the copywriter turns one concept into 

a representation of another. There is an association between the name used and the thing that it stands for. The quality 
of water is essential in mineral water production and a distinction is made between water that is good and pure and 

untreated water. The word sachet is also associated with Voltic Cool Pac which is the final product in a sachet form. 

The metonymy literary device has been placed at the initial part of the text and this grabs the attention of the reader and 

prepares them for the other attributes of the sachet mineral water.    

The second line of the text contains series of adjectives: cool, fresh and clean which draw the reader’s attention to 

outstanding qualities of the Voltic Cool Pac. After attracting the attention of the audience by the use of the metonymy 

device and modifiers, the copywriter then introduces the advertized product and emphasizes the quality of the sachet 

mineral water: Enjoy the high quality standards that Voltic (Gh) Limited is famous for. The copywriter ends the textual 

message with a rhetorical question whose answer is obvious and it compels the reader to provide the answer: Why 

compromise on Quality? The use of the metonymy figure of speech makes the English of the textual message figurative. 

The English is attractive since it is different from the usual literal meaning. 

Text 3 

Hisense King Kong 

The strongest phone ever 

The Hisense King Kong has full HD-IPS display, an attractive sleek phone that comfortably fits in one hand. 

The Hisense King Kong can be safely immersed in water up to 1.5 meters deep for 30 minutes. 

Dust protection against ingress of particles sealed rubber edges and a shock-resistant glass screen provide for 

perfect smash protection 

Hisense, everyday prices for everyday people 

(Daily Graphic, Monday, May 22, 2017, P. 95)  

The text is introduced by the name of the advertised product Hisense King Kong mobile phone. The name of the cell 

phone is striking because King Kong is an allusion to a famous movie. This is an implicit reference to a literary 

production. The use of the allusion rhetorical device appeals to the reader to share their knowledge. This strategy 
associates the reader with the advertising message. The use of King Kong by the copywriter also illustrates the 

alliteration device. The repetition of the same consonant sound /k/ in succession attracts the potential customer’s 

attention to the advertised phone.  

Having grabbed the attention of the reader to the Hisense King Kong phone, the copywriter then strongly states its 

quality in the second line: The strongest phone ever. This exaggeration is to project the image of the phone over and 

above other brands of mobile phone on the market. The copywriter makes an extreme claim for the phone in order to 

attract the attention of readers. The third sentential structure of the text also illustrates a deliberate overstatement of a 

unique feature of the phone: The Hisense King Kong has full HD-IPS display. In expressing the water-proof quality of 

the phone, the copywriter presented more than the truth about the safety of the phone: The Hisense King Kong can be 

safely immersed in water up to 1.5 meters deep for 30 minutes. At the final segment of the text, the copywriter also 

deliberately exaggerates the other features of the phone for attraction and emphasis. The line dust protection against 
ingress of particles is hyperbolic because it is overstated and this creates a striking image. In the line a shock-resistant 

glass screen provide for perfect smash protection, the quality of the glass covering the surface of the phone has been 

over expressed. The use of the hyperbole literary device departs from the literal meaning to create a mental picture of 

the attributes of the advertised phone. For instance, the reader can imagine a phone whose main screen is fortified so 
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that it will never get cracked or smashed. The use of the hyperbole figure of speech has made the English of the 

advertising text figurative. 

Text 4 

Diamond Cement 

Trusted quality cement 

Higher grade 

Super fine cement 

Most affordable priced cement 

Diamond Cement; The Builder’s choice!! 

(Daily Guide, Friday, February 10, 2017, P. 1) 

In the text above, the copywriter repeats the word cement, the advertised product, throughout the text. Repetition is a 
rhetorical figure and its use makes the English of the text striking. The use of the repetition device is a departure from 

the usual order of words in English. It thus engages the reader and creates an image in their mind. The repetition of 

cement is for emphasis. By the use of this rhetorical device the image of the advertised product is uplifted in the text and 

this draws the attention of the audience. Repetition also highlights the advertising message and plants the name cement 

in their mind for consideration. 

Text 5 

uPVC windows with net 

Our uPVC  

Doesn’t fade 

It doesn’t rust 

It doesn’t recoil 
It has soundproof 

It’s durable & stronger 

It doesn’t produce heat (Daily Graphic, Thursday, March 23, 2017, P. 9) 

The text contains similarly constructed grammatical structures; they are parallel constructions with identical syntactic 

patterns. The parallel structures in the text can be seen below: 

Our uPVC doesn’t fade  

It doesn’t rust 

It doesn’t recoil 

These similar syntactic structures comprise a subject element and a verb phrase. The use of the parallelism rhetorical 

device makes the English of the text figurative. The parallelism in the text shows a departure from the usual 

arrangement of grammatical structures in English; however, the copywriter has employed it to make the English of the 
text attractive to the readers. The repetition of the parallel structures is also for emphasis of the qualities and attributes 

of the advertised product, the uPVC windows. The other syntactic structures in the text also contribute to portraying the 

qualities of the advertised windows: It has soundproof, It is durable & stronger, It doesn’t produce heat. 

Text 6 

Bridgestone: Your journey, our passion 

The Turanza 

Minimises road noise 

Maximises driving comfort 

Broad range from 13 to 18 

Excellent roadholding and handling 

(Daily Graphic, Friday, March 10, 2017, P. 11)  

The text begins with a slogan of the advertising company: Bridgestone: Your journey, our passion. The words of the 
slogan create a personal effect; they establish a friendly relationship between the copywriter and the customers. In order 

to draw the reader’s attention to the advertized product (The Turanza Bridgestone Tyre) the copywriter employs the 

antithesis rhetorical device: Minimizes road noise, Maximizes driving comfort. This rhetorical figure makes the English 

of the text attractive. The antithesis demonstrates a departure from the usual order of words in English and this creates a 

rhetorical effect. In the antithesis, there are ideas that are directly opposed: minimize is in contrast with maximize and 

road noise is also in contrast with driving comfort. The antithetical device has similar syntactic structures which creates 

a rhetorical balance. The use of antithesis in the English of the above text draws the attention of the audience to the 

advertised product as the English is presented in an unusual way. The last line of the text demonstrates the copywriter’s 

use of the hyperbolic trope: Excellent road holding and handling. In this coordinated structure, the copywriter 

overstates the attributes of the Bridgestone tyre to add emphasis to the textual message. 

Text 7  
The Suzuki Grand Vitara 

Ride the rough with comfort 

Expand your boundaries 

Go anywhere in style 
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On the move-mind at rest 

Revolution in cross-country 

(Daily Graphic, Monday, July 24, 2017, P. 94) 

The first line of the text is the name of the advertised car: The Suzuki Grand Vitara. The second line is an imperative 

sentence which exhibits the use of paradox by the copywriter. However, the phrase the rough illustrates the use of the 

metonymy figure of speech. In this metonymic phrase, the literal term for one thing rough is applied to another road 

with which it has become closely associated due to the continuous relationship that exit between the two terms. In 

another sense, the noun phrase the rough is in contrast with the prepositional phrase with comfort. The juxtaposition of 

the two phrases makes the line paradoxical in that the two phrases contradict each other and this makes the meaning of 

the line absurd. However, if one examines or interprets the contradiction, one realizes that the statement makes sense. 

Using the second line of the text as illustration, it can be realized that a rough road connotes discomfort, displeasure and 
uneasiness, but, because of the nature of the advertized car, the Suzuki Grand Vitara, even though the road may be 

rough, the car has good shock absorbers, it is stable and weighty, so the ride will be comfortable, pleasurable, easy and 

enjoyable. The use of figures of speech in the second line of the text makes the English figurative and attractive. The 

figures of speech draw the reader’s attention to the car. They make the reader think and they create mental images.  

Having attracted the attention of the reader through the use of the figurative English in line two of the text, the 

copywriter goes on to address the reader directly in an assertive way. The third line of the text is an imperative sentence 

whose implied subject is the reader: Expand your boundaries. The copywriter is urging the reader to own the advertised 

car since it has more features to be experienced. The fourth line of the text is also an imperative statement: Go 

anywhere in style. It is speaking to the reader in an aggressive manner. The statement is assuring the reader that the 

Suzuki Grand Vitara can be driven on any road. The fifth line of the text is also assuring the reader that it is safe to 

drive the car; there will be no mechanical faults: On the move-mind at rest. The last line of the text presents a new 
attribute of the advertised car. The impression created is that the car is reliable and it is capable of taking the 

prospective owner to any part of the country, irrespective of the distance and nature of the road: Revolution in cross-

country. In the text above, the copywriter employs paradox for a rhetorical effect. In its use, the copywriter juxtaposes 

two contradictory phrases which make the English absurd. However, the analysis reconciles the contrast and the English 

then makes sense. The use of paradox engages the reader and creates images of the advertised car in the reader’s mind. 

VII.  ANALYSIS OF THE FINDINGS 

The analysis of the advertising text data revealed that copywriters in the print media in Ghana employed figures of 

speech in the English of advertisements for persuasive effect. The use of figures of speech in the texts was characterized 

by unusual use of English in which one thing was associated with another or dissimilar entities were compared. The 

figures of speech employed in the advertisements illustrated a departure from the literal meaning or the usual 

arrangement of words to create a picture in the mind of the audience. 
 The texts exhibited the copywriters’ use of the two major categories of figure of speech, namely, tropes and 

rhetorical figures. The tropes that were employed in the advertising texts were: metaphor, personification, metonymy, 

synecdoche and hyperbole. The rhetorical figures that were used in the advertisements were: Rhetorical question, 

antithesis, parallelism, repetition, paradox, allusion and alliteration. The use of tropes in the texts departed from the 

literal meaning of words to the figurative. With tropes, the copywriters used words in such a way that their standard 

meanings changed; for instance, one thing was turned to mean something else or one entity was used as a representation 

of another. The use of tropes in the texts also involved a comparison of unlike entities to suggest a similarity and an 

unexpected connection established between two dissimilar things. With tropes, the copywriters presented the English of 

the advertising texts in an unusual way and this attracted the attention of the audience to the advertised products. On the 

other hand, the use of the rhetorical figures in the advertising texts was a departure from the usual order of words in 

English to create a certain rhetorical effect. With rhetorical figures the copywriters employed words in an unusual way 

to create an attractive effect without significantly changing their meanings. Unlike the use of tropes in the textual data 
that brought about a radical change in the meaning of words, the rhetorical figures employed departed from the usual 

standard syntactic pattern of words to create a striking and attractive image in the mind of the audience. The use of 

figures of speech made the English of the advertising texts figurative. Figures of speech attracted the attention of the 

audience to the advertised products. They engaged the audience and made them think about the advertising textual 

message.  

VIII.  CONCLUSION 

Advertising is a channel through which information about the availability of goods and services is transmitted to the 

consuming public. Advertising is employed to stimulate interest or desire, create need and to attract attention to 

manufactured products. Although a number of elements constitute an advertisement, language plays a pivotal role in the 

transmission of the message. The current study revealed that copywriters employed figures of speech (tropes and 

rhetorical figures) in the English of advertisements in the newspapers in Ghana. The use of figures of speech in the 
English of the advertising texts made it possible for the copywriters to present the English language in an unusual and 
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attractive way. Figurative expressions in the English of the advertising texts gave the language a meaning different from 

the literal interpretation and this had persuasive effect on the audience.  
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